Sale number

Municipality

25-2867
25-2862
25-2871
25-2872
25-2875
25-2886
25-2888
25-2890
25-2893
25-2900
25-2913
25-2920
25-2924
25-3010
25-2941
25-2942
25-2947
25-2948
25-2987
25-2994
25-2998
25-2999
25-3002
25-2972

BEAR CREEK TWP

BLACK CREEK TWP
DALLAS TWP

DENNISON TWP

EXETER BORO WARD 1
FOSTER TWP

HANOVER TWP WARD 4
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HUNLOCK TWP

LAKE TWP

NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8
PENN LAKE PARK BORO
PLAINS TWP WARD 1
PLAINS TWP WARD 1
SALEM TWP

SUGARLOAF TWP
WILKES-BARRE WARD 2
WILKES-BARRE WARD 10
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WYOMING BORO WARD 3

Parcel

04-N12S2 -003-004-000
03-U4S4 -001-08A-000
10-E8510 -00A-005-000
13-N12 -00A-020-000
16-D11S1 -005-017-000
23-R9S3 -003-009-000
25-1I9NW1 -014-018-000
26-T5S1 -001-114-000
26-U5S2 -008-017-000
29-15 -00A-51M-000
37-C5 -00A-65A-000
42-J7NW1 -001-004-000
42-K7S1 -010-008-000
75-N12S1 -005-002-000
50-G10NE1-001-007-000
50-G10NE1-001-07A-000
55-P4S1 -002-012-000
58-Q6 -00A-08B-000
73-H10SW1-011-002-000
73-H9SE1 -010-005-000
73-19NE4 -002-005-000
73-1SNE4 -002-006-000
73-19NE4 -020-023-000
67-F10S1 -002-05B-000

Owner

OELKE HAILEY

REINHART JACK WILSON SR & ANGELA
THOMAS JOHN C & PATRICIA
ZWIEBEL CHRISTOPHER R & DENISE A
BULLOCK FRANK & MARY ANN L
GIMBI FREDERIC P

GRIBBLE KENNETH H

FAJUTAGANA FRANK & CATHERINE V
ILDEFONSO RODERICK & MARIANNE
STRICKLAND GLEN P

HETTES TIFFANY &

ARCHER ELIZABETH MARIE

KREAMER EILEEN

SMALTZ ELIZABETH & RITAT
WESTAWSKI TIMOTHY & SHARON
WESTAWSKI TIMOTHY L.

MOWERY GORDON E & EVAM

BOLUS BOB SR &

KASPER DONALD

CLARK ANTOINE DANTE

MARX SHEET METAL & MECHANICAL INC
MARX SHEET METAL & MECHANICAL INC
MORALES MIGUEL

FETCH DAVID JR

Property Description
AZALEA TRL

10 STAUFFER AVE
204 HILLSIDE

32 ADJ BRIDGE LN
1143 EXETER AVE
413 SCOTCH HILL

27 GOERINGER AVE
GREEN MT DR

E TUSCARORA DR
1755 MAIN RD
SORBER MOUNTAIN RD
211 HONEY POT ST
129 CENTER ST

1649 LAKESIDE DR

7 MCCULLOUGH ST
MCCULLOUGH ST
1339 SALEM BLVD
Route 00093

129 SCOTT ST

64 TERRACE ST

38 ADJ BRADFORD ST
26 ADJ BRADFORD ST
102 HOLLAND ST

913 WYOMING AVE

Upset Price
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

set Price

4,785.16
11,033.23
21,159.70
3,742.16
14,405.55
7,655.69
62,516.67
2,654.75
3,860.86
18,090.58
2,640.54
13,297.99
20,732.09
31,436.30
3,449.91
3,446.52
31,203.42
62,407.51
29,225.59
18,989.97
4,794.96
5,043.33
11,221.40
189,087.69

Results

No bid

Sold to bidder #95 for $27,000.00
Removed - bankruptcy filed
Removed - taxes paid

Sold to bidder #360 for $14,405.55
Removed - taxes paid

Sold to bidder #233 for $62,516.67
No bid

Sold to bidder #202 for $3,860.86
Removed - bankruptcy filed

No bid

Sold to bidder #212 for $53,000.00
Removed - taxes paid

Removed due to Court Order

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #196 for $36,000.00
Removed - bankruptcy filed

Bidder forfeit - off to Judicial Sale
Sold to bidder #19 for $104,000.00
Bidder forfeit - off to Judicial Sale
Sold to bidder #65 for $19,500.00
Sold to bidder #456 for $82,000.00
No bid




